

EXHIBIT 14

Anderson Kill P.C.

1251 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10020-1182

(212) 278-1000

EIN: 13-2743351

E-Mail: Accounting@andersonkill.com

Pimental Class
c/o Robert A. Swift, Esq.
Kohn Swift & Graf, P.C.
One South Broad Street, 21st Floor
Philadelphia, PA 19107

DATE: January 7, 2019
MATTER: 101199.PIM02
INVOICE: 288780

MATTER: MARCOS LITIGATION

Jeffrey E Glen

INVOICE SUMMARY

Professional Services:	85,658.50
Costs:	<u>2,594.59</u>
Total Current Invoice:	<u>\$88,253.09</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE:	<u>\$88,253.09</u>

Anderson Kill P.C.

1251 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10020-1182

(212) 278-1000

EIN: 13-2743351

E-Mail: Accounting@andersonkill.com

Page 2

PIMENTAL CLASS

MATTER: 101199.PIM02

January 7, 2019

INVOICE: 288780

MATTER: MARCOS LITIGATION

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES through 12/31/18

INIT	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES
JEG	07/10/13	0.80	Offconf Luma, Offconf Flynn, re transfer of case to Ramos. Telcnfs Ware, Swift, re proposal to discontinue in exchange for fixed date for refiling.
LSA	07/11/13	1.50	Reviewed notice of petition; reviewed emails from court regarding filing status; discussed same with D. Flynn; prepared amended RJL for filing and service; instructions to D. Flynn re: same
LSA	07/12/13	0.20	Reviewing docket activity
LSA	08/01/13	0.70	Emails and review of docket re: return date for August 2, 2013; discussion with JEG re: same; telephone conference with M. Ware re: same; stipulation re: same
LSA	08/07/13	1.20	Reviewed docket sheet entries in connection with recent order entered by Judge Ramos and discrepancy re: which motion it related to; discussion with D. Flynn regarding same; email to Judge Ramos, copied to respondents' and intervenors' counsel regarding clarification and request to correct docket re: same.
LSA	08/15/13	1.20	Pulling and saving McClaughlin NOM, Memo of Law and Supporting Affirmation with Exhibits A-R, saving these locally and emailing same to R. Swift so that he can access them; discussion with D. Flynn re: response time
LSA	08/16/13	0.50	Review correspondence with McClaughlin re motion
JEG	08/21/13	1.30	TCs and emails Swift, Luma, Ware, McLaughlin, all re scheduling and issues for argument on new turnover motion.
JEG	09/11/13	0.40	TC Swift, OC Luma, Telconf McLaughlin, all re Merrill motion
LSA	09/11/13	0.60	Reviewing docket and email correspondence to determine adjournment/extension for intervenor per JEG request; discussions with D. Flynn re: same
JEG	09/12/13	0.30	TC Rothfeld re Merrill motion, emails Rothfeld and Ware, TC Swift.
LSA	09/17/13	0.40	Checking docket and file and responding to questions from B. Swift concerning petition and motion to dismiss.

Anderson Kill P.C.

1251 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10020-1182
(212) 278-1000 EIN: 13-2743351
E-Mail: Accounting@andersonkill.com

Page 3

PIMENTAL CLASS

MATTER: 101199.PIM02

January 7, 2019

INVOICE: 288780

MATTER: MARCOS LITIGATION

INIT	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES
JEG	09/19/13	0.60	TCs Swift x3, McLaughlin x2, OC Luma, TC Flynn all re getting our cross-motion to Merrill motion calendared.
LSA	09/20/13	0.80	Drafted stipulation to adjourn; emails and correspondence with Defendants re: same
LSA	09/23/13	1.00	Finalizing stip for adjournment; instructions for filing of same; pulling and reviewing R. Swift draft in response to Merrill's MTD and preparing packet of materials for JEG
LSA	09/24/13	1.50	Prepared affirmation; revised and finalized papers re: cross motion and preparations for filing of same
LSA	10/01/13	0.50	Reviewing intervention motion and emails re: same to R.Swift
LSA	10/02/13	1.00	Review correspondence and draft of response to Ware intervention
LSA	10/03/13	1.00	Review and final preparations for filing and service; attempting to ascertain whether hearing on October 9 is going forward through discussions with court and with managing clerk's office
JEG	10/04/13	0.40	Various emails counsel on the Swezey petition re upcoming arguments, TC Swift re tactics
LSA	10/04/13	3.00	Reviewed papers filed by Merrill Lynch and Arelma/PNB re: arguments; retrieved relevant documents pertaining to Merrill motion, Swezey Opp. and Cross-Motion, Arelma/PNB motion, and Swezey Opp to Arelma motion and prepared packet of materials for JEG; discussions with D. Flynn re: hearing date; review of case docket
LSA	10/07/13	0.50	Conference call with chambers and follow up with D. Flynn re: same
LSA	10/08/13	2.50	Follow-up re: adjourned hearing date; correspondence re: stipulation with Ware, et al.; forwarding complete sets of motion sequence documents to NYC Department of Finance counsel per his request, including retrieval and preparation of same; file management.
LSA	10/09/13	1.00	Review docket entries; discussion and email re: adjournment date
LSA	10/10/13	0.50	Follow up emails re: hearing date and return date; discussion with managing clerk re:same
JEG	10/15/13	0.40	Prepping for tomorrow's argument

Anderson Kill P.C.

1251 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10020-1182

(212) 278-1000

EIN: 13-2743351

E-Mail: Accounting@andersonkill.com

Page 4

PIMENTAL CLASS

MATTER: 101199.PIM02

January 7, 2019

INVOICE: 288780

MATTER: MARCOS LITIGATION

INIT	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES
LSA	10/15/13	0.50	Reviewed reply of Arelma and PNB in support of motion to dismiss (motion sequence 4) and notes re: issues re: same
JEG	10/16/13	2.30	Hearing before Justice Ramos, conf with Swift before and after
LSA	10/17/13	2.50	Researching issues pertaining to finality of judgments for article 53 proceedings and money judgment issue and drafting email of research to JEG, R Swift
LSA	11/07/13	0.50	Review of order; review motion sequence 3 and notes from hearing and email to R. Swift re: same
VCM	11/11/13	0.50	Conference with L. Al-Shibi re: case history and procedural posture. Phone call with D. McLaughlin requesting a copy of transcript of Motion Sequence 3 hearing.
VCM	12/03/13	0.30	Reviewed proposed settlement order and corresponded with J. Glen re: same.
VCM	01/26/14	2.10	Began reviewing Swezey file.
VCM	03/03/14	3.40	Conference with J. Glen re: Swezey motion to reargue. Review briefs in Swezey II. Draft outline of motion to reargue.
VCM	03/04/14	5.60	Begin drafting motion to reargue.
VCM	03/06/14	7.60	Complete draft of motion to reargue.
VCM	03/12/14	0.10	Correspond with J. Glen and R. Swift re: draft motion to reargue.
VCM	03/18/14	1.60	Began revising motion for leave to reargue.
VCM	03/19/14	0.20	Completed revision of motion for leave to reargue. Correspond with J. Glen and R. Swift re: same.
VCM	03/24/14	1.20	Communicate with R. Swift re: changes to motion for leave to reargue. Begin revising brief, affidavit, exhibits, and notice of motion.
VCM	03/25/14	2.10	Finalize and file motion and supporting papers for leave to reargue.
VCM	04/07/14	0.30	Review opposition to motion for leave to reargue. Correspond with R. Swift and J. Glen re: same.
VCM	04/08/14	0.10	Review draft of reply in motion for leave to reargue.
VCM	04/09/14	1.50	Finalize and file reply motion for leave to reargue. Communicate with R. Swift and J. Glen re: same.

Anderson Kill P.C.

1251 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10020-1182

(212) 278-1000

EIN: 13-2743351

E-Mail: Accounting@andersonkill.com

Page 5

PIMENTAL CLASS

MATTER: 101199.PIM02

January 7, 2019

INVOICE: 288780

MATTER: MARCOS LITIGATION

INIT	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES
VCM	04/10/14	0.40	Prepared for filing and filed letter to Judge Ramos.
VCM	04/21/14	0.50	Review letter from M. Ware. File R. Swift's response letter.
JEG	05/08/14	2.60	Prep for argument on motion to vacate stay. Attend at argument with Bob Swift re same.
VCM	05/12/14	0.50	File proposed order to vacate the stay.
VCM	05/13/14	1.40	Draft and file letter to Judge Ramos re: previously filed proposed order. Draft notice to settle. Correspond with J. Glen re: same.
VCM	05/19/14	0.30	Refile settlement of proposed order with correct caption. Draft letter to Judge Ramos re: same. Communicate with J. Glen and R. Swift re: same.
VCM	06/02/14	0.30	Review Judge Ramos 5/22 order. Correspond with D. Flynn and J. Glen re: same.
VCM	06/03/14	0.20	Correspond with R. Swift, J. Glen, and D. Flynn re: status of Judge Ramos 5/22 order.
VCM	06/06/14	0.20	Conference with M. Ware re: transcript in last hearing.
VCM	06/10/14	0.30	Communicate with J. Glen and D. Flynn re: status of Swezey order.
VCM	06/12/14	0.10	Conference with J. Glen re: Swezey transcript and correspondence with M. Ware.
VCM	06/13/14	1.30	Review Judge Ramos' order re: Motion Sequence 5. Prepare notice of entry. Serve on Philippine Consulate and Embassy in accordance with Order. Prepare affidavit of service. Correspond with J. Glen and R. Swift re: same.
VCM	06/17/14	0.10	Review stipulation re: transcript. Correspond with M. Ware and J. Glen re: same.
VCM	07/10/14	0.20	Review Arelma notice of appeal and review CPLR re: effect of notice of appeal.
VCM	07/11/14	0.30	Determine deadlines based on Arelma notice of appeal and Judge Marcos' order on motion to stay. Correspond with R. Swift and J. Glen re: same.
JEG	07/15/14	3.10	Review pre-argument statement. Telconf Swift re possible motion to dismiss appeal. Research on same. Research on grounds for opposing stay, "affected party" issue.

Anderson Kill P.C.

1251 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10020-1182
(212) 278-1000 EIN: 13-2743351
E-Mail: Accounting@andersonkill.com

Page 6

PIMENTAL CLASS

MATTER: 101199.PIM02

January 7, 2019

INVOICE: 288780

MATTER: MARCOS LITIGATION

INIT	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES
JEG	07/16/14	0.70	Telconfs Calica re App Div scheduling, telconf Swift re same, memo re same.
VCM	07/16/14	0.20	Coordinate with R. Swift and J. Glen re: strategy for response to PNB appeal and motion for stay.
VCM	07/17/14	0.20	Conference with J. Glen re: strategy with respect to stay application at the First Department.
JEG	07/21/14	2.70	Initial review of stay motion papers, TC Swift.
VCM	07/21/14	2.60	Reviewed PNB's motion for a stay. Attend application for stay at First Department to set briefing schedule.
JEG	07/22/14	4.10	Working on appealability section of MOL for App Div stay application
VCM	07/22/14	0.90	Coordinate with J. Glen and R. Swift re: drafting opposition to PNB motion to stay and cross-motion to dismiss the appeal.
JEG	07/23/14	3.40	Continued drafting of appealability section, review/revise draft MOL, various TCs Swift. REview/revise proposed final version of MOL, review Swift affidavit
VCM	07/24/14	3.20	Prepare opposition to motion for stay and cross-motion to dismiss appeal for filing. Organize and compile exhibits. Add citations to brief and to affidavit of R. Swift. Review papers for consistency, typos, etc.
VCM	07/25/14	1.10	Draft supplemental affirmation of V. Michael and gather exhibits. Finalize filing of opposition and cross-motion to dismiss.
JEG	07/30/14	0.40	Initial review of PNB reply MOL. NOte to Swift re same
JEG	08/04/14	0.80	Begin review of exhibits submitted by PNB with initial appeals brief.
JEG	08/11/14	0.80	Various telconfs Swift re next steps on appeal, issues arising from DOJ involvement. Offconf Michael re research on judicial notice issues
VCM	08/11/14	0.30	Review rules re: time to file reply brief and correspond with R. Swift re: same.

Anderson Kill P.C.

1251 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10020-1182

(212) 278-1000

EIN: 13-2743351

E-Mail: Accounting@andersonkill.com

Page 7

PIMENTAL CLASS

MATTER: 101199.PIM02

January 7, 2019

INVOICE: 288780

MATTER: MARCOS LITIGATION

INIT	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES
VCM	08/12/14	2.10	Secondary source research re: judicial notice of foreign court judgments and diplomatic letters. Review Appellate Division opinion re: judicial notice generally. Draft summary email to J. Glen and R. Swift re: same.
VCM	08/13/14	4.30	Complete case law research re judicial notice of foreign court decisions and diplomatic letters.
VCM	08/14/14	2.50	Draft summary of judicial notice research for R. Swift and J. Glen.
VCM	08/18/14	0.60	Correspond with J. Glen and R. Swift re: letter to appellate division. Prepare appellate division letter for delivery. Phone call with appellate division clerk re: reason for clerk's rejection of letter. Draft correspondence to R. Swift and J. Glen re: same.
JEG	08/20/14	1.60	REview DOJ brief, annotate same. REview Swift's second draft of answering brief.
VCM	08/22/14	1.70	Review PNB/Arelma appellate brief and amicus brief of U.S. Dep't of Justice. Review draft opposition brief.
EWM	08/25/14	0.70	Review documents for appellate brief filing.
JEG	08/25/14	1.50	Memo to team re second draft of AD brief
VCM	08/25/14	0.20	Conference with J. Glen and E. Middlebrooks re: status of appellate briefing and coordinate drafting and filing re: same.
EWM	08/26/14	2.80	Reviewed appellant's and respondents briefs in preparation for response on appealability.
EWM	08/26/14	0.40	Telephone conference with R Swift, J Glen and V Michael re reply appellate brief.
EWM	08/26/14	0.20	Conference with J Glen and V Michael re appealability issue in reply appellate brief.
EWM	08/26/14	3.10	Legal research re: appealability of June 2 2014 Order.
JEG	08/26/14	2.40	Offconf Ethan M. outlining research and redraft re appealability. Revise Swift's second draft of AP brief in track changes
VCM	08/26/14	0.90	Coordinate with J. Glen, E. Middlebrooks, and R. Swift re: draft of appellate brief and preparation of supplemental record.
EWM	08/27/14	1.30	Work on draft of appealability section.
EWM	08/27/14	2.30	Legal research re: appealability section of reply appellate brief.

Anderson Kill P.C.

1251 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10020-1182

(212) 278-1000

EIN: 13-2743351

E-Mail: Accounting@andersonkill.com

Page 8

PIMENTAL CLASS

MATTER: 101199.PIM02

January 7, 2019

INVOICE: 288780

MATTER: MARCOS LITIGATION

INIT	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES
EWM	08/27/14	0.90	Reviewed documents in preparation for appealability section of respondent's reply appellate brief.
JEG	08/27/14	2.20	Review Sherry's material on committee, memo to Swift re nexus between comity and 1001 prejudice argument. Various emails to/from Swift re proposed changes in brief.
VCM	08/27/14	0.20	Conference with E. Middlebrooks re: supplemental record.
EWM	08/28/14	0.60	Corresponded with J Glen regarding appealability issue.
EWM	08/28/14	1.40	Work on draft of appealability section.
EWM	08/29/14	5.00	Prepare documents for respondent's appellate brief production.
EWM	08/29/14	0.40	Corresponded with J Glen, B Swift & V Michael re supplemental record production for respondent's appellate brief.
EWM	08/29/14	0.60	Work on respondent's appellate brief updates.
JEG	08/29/14	2.30	Redrafting appealability section
VCM	08/29/14	1.20	Coordinate with E. Middlebrooks and D. Flynn re: printing, preparing, and finalizing respondent's appellate brief.
EWM	09/02/14	8.40	Reviewed and revised Respondent's Appellate Brief and supplemental record for filing.
VCM	09/02/14	0.40	Conference with E. Middlebrooks and D. Flynn re: strategies for adding turnover petition to supplemental record. Locate draft stipulation to supplement record and prior motion to supplement the record in Swezey I.
EWM	09/03/14	4.20	Prepared Appellees' Brief for First Department service and filing, and filed.
JEG	09/03/14	0.40	VArious offconfs Ethan M re completion and filing of App Div brief, review/sign oral argument request
VCM	09/03/14	0.40	Assist with filing respondent's appellate brief.
EWM	09/08/14	0.10	Reviewed September 8, 2014 Order
VCM	09/09/14	0.30	Attend to file.
EWM	09/12/14	0.50	Prepared intervenors' reply brief for internal and team review
EWM	09/12/14	0.70	Reviewed Intervenors' Reply Brief
EWM	09/15/14	0.10	Communicated with team regarding oral argument schedule.

Anderson Kill P.C.

1251 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10020-1182

(212) 278-1000

EIN: 13-2743351

E-Mail: Accounting@andersonkill.com

Page 9

PIMENTAL CLASS

MATTER: 101199.PIM02

January 7, 2019

INVOICE: 288780

MATTER: MARCOS LITIGATION

INIT	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES
VCM	09/15/14	0.20	Research and inquire into status of R. Swift pro hac vice admission in First Department.
EWM	09/16/14	0.80	Drafted letter to clerk of First Dept re R Swift admission.
EWM	09/16/14	0.20	Communicated with D Flynn and J Glen regarding R Swift's admission for oral argument.
EWM	09/16/14	0.20	Communicated with B Swift, J Glen and V Michael re pro hac admission in 1st Dept
EWM	09/24/14	0.10	Reviewed notice of appeal from e-file
EWM	10/07/14	0.10	Communicated with J Glen re letter from court clerk re pro hac vice admission for B Swift
EWM	10/10/14	0.20	Communicated with R Swift and V Michael re pro hac vice admission
EWM	10/14/14	0.30	Communicated with R Swift re appellate brief
EWM	10/14/14	0.10	Communicated with R Swift et al re oral argument
EWM	10/15/14	0.10	Communicated with R Swift re pro hac vice admission approval
EWM	10/16/14	0.20	Communicated with D Flynn re changes to brief in preparation for oral argument
EWM	10/17/14	0.30	Prepared materials for oral argument.
JEG	10/19/14	2.80	Review appellate briefs. memo Swift re prepping for oral argument
EWM	10/22/14	0.10	Communicated with J Glen, B Swift and D Flynn re 1st Dept Panel
EWM	10/22/14	0.50	Prepared for pre-oral argument meeting
EWM	10/23/14	0.30	E109 LOCAL TRAVEL to/from First Department
EWM	10/23/14	3.40	Attended oral argument.
EWM	10/23/14	0.50	Meeting with B Swift and J Glen to prepare for oral argument
EWM	10/23/14	0.50	Prepared materials for oral argument
JEG	10/23/14	3.80	Prep for oral argument at First Department. Attend at argument
EWM	11/18/14	0.20	Review and analysis of First Department opinion re appeal from motion to reargue and stay
EWM	01/13/15	0.20	Review case updates and notice of entry of First Department decision

Anderson Kill P.C.

1251 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10020-1182
(212) 278-1000 EIN: 13-2743351
E-Mail: Accounting@andersonkill.com

Page 10

PIMENTAL CLASS

MATTER: 101199.PIM02

January 7, 2019

INVOICE: 288780

MATTER: MARCOS LITIGATION

INIT	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES
EWM	03/24/15	0.10	Review case files in preparation of serving response to stay (.1)
JEG	04/08/15	1.60	Review Ramos decision. Emails to/from Swift re same and next steps. Offconf Passannante updating.
JEG	05/12/15	3.30	Research re mandamus. memo Swift re same. Research on Court of Appeals power to grant leave to appeal. memo Swift re same
EWM	05/13/15	0.10	Review First Department decision on vacating stay
JEG	06/01/15	3.80	Review Bob Swift draft second motion to vacate stay. Research. Draft new version. Telconf Swift re same.
EWM	06/15/15	0.40	Review and analyze PNB's Opposition to Motion to Vacate Stay of Proceedings
VCM	08/26/15	0.20	Call to First Department clerk re: filing reply in support of motion for leave to appeal and emails to J. Glen/R. Swift re: same.
JEG	08/27/15	4.50	Various emails Michael and Donlon re replying to opposition to our motion for leave to appeal. Research and drafting reply. Emails Swift re same. Emails Donlon re service and filing.
NJD	08/27/15	2.00	Emails and discussions with J. Glen, V. Michael, Y. Robdriguez, and B. Swift re Appellate Division Reply Papers; Telephone calls to Clerk of Court; Attention to service and filing logistics; Draft affidavit of service.
VCM	08/27/15	0.20	Coordinate with N. Donlon re: filing reply brief in support of motion for leave to appeal.
NJD	08/28/15	2.50	Emails with J. Glen and B. Swift; Prepare and serve service copies of Appellate Division Reply Memo of Law; Revise and execute affidavit of service; File Reply Memo of Law at Appellate Division, First Department.
DF	10/22/15	2.00	Assembled, served and filed Notice of Motion to Stay on Transfer Memorandum of Law Appellate Division.
DF	11/17/15	2.00	Assemble Motion and Memorandum of Law to Lift Stay; Prepared Affidavit of Service filed with Appellate Division
JEG	02/04/16	2.60	Research on writ of King's Bench. Research on original jurisdiction of NY Court of Appeals. Note to Swift re same. Telconf Swift re same

Anderson Kill P.C.

1251 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10020-1182

(212) 278-1000

EIN: 13-2743351

E-Mail: Accounting@andersonkill.com

Page 11

PIMENTAL CLASS

MATTER: 101199.PIM02

January 7, 2019

INVOICE: 288780

MATTER: MARCOS LITIGATION

INIT	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES
JEG	03/01/16	0.60	Review letter from Chief clerk Asiello. Telconf Swift re same and next steps.
JEG	03/03/16	1.30	TC Swift re kings bench application. Draft ltr to Asiello re same. TCs and emails Swift re same, draft revisions.
JEG	03/07/16	1.20	Review/revise letter to Asiello re writ of Kings Bench, various emails and drafts for Swift phv applications, various telconfs re service issues.
JEG	04/05/16	0.40	Telconf Swift re Ware response to Kings Bench motion, reply to same
EWM	10/07/16	0.40	Review materials concerning court request for status update (.1) and confer with J Glen and B Swift regarding the same (.3)
EWM	10/11/16	1.00	Communicate with J Glen concerning court Status Inquiry request (.1) and prepare response to N.Y. Supreme Court. (.9)
EWM	10/12/16	0.20	Review and analysis concerning court status inquiry (.1) and communicate with J Glen re same (.1).
EWM	10/14/16	0.50	Prepare and send to court and other parties status inquiry response
JEG	08/22/17	1.20	Emails and telcalls Swift re 2% fee assessed by NYC DOF. Research re same.
JEG	12/04/17	0.70	Draft followup letter to Atik.
JEG	12/05/17	0.30	Note to Swift re tactics for motion.
JEG	12/13/17	0.60	.TCs Swift, note to Ware
JEG	01/12/18	4.50	Motion and supporting papers for order requiring NYC Dept of Finance to turn over remaining funds to State Comptroller
JEG	03/07/18	2.80	Review City answering papers on funds transfer motion, ddrafting reply papers, various emails and telconfs Swift re same, telconf Burkett rescheduling.
DRF	03/20/18	0.50	Submitted working copy of reply to Judge Ramos.
JEG	10/10/18	1.20	Review/revise Swift affirmation, telconf Swift re next steps
JEG	10/11/18	1.40	REview/revise Memo of law, Draft notice of motion, offconf Flynn r filing requirements, telconf Swif.
DRF	10/12/18	0.20	Filed Motion to Vacate Stay with supporting documents in NYS Supreme Court.

Anderson Kill P.C.

1251 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10020-1182
(212) 278-1000 EIN: 13-2743351
E-Mail: Accounting@andersonkill.com

Page 12

PIMENTAL CLASS

MATTER: 101199.PIM02

January 7, 2019

INVOICE: 288780

MATTER: MARCOS LITIGATION

INIT	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES
JEG	10/17/18	0.70	Various emails and telconfs Ware, Swift, re adjourning our motion to vacate the stay.
JEG	11/07/18	1.70	REview reply MOL on motion to vacate stay. Telconf Swift re same. Arrange filing. Prepare order for settlement on NCYDOF payment to NYS Comptroller. Prep0are and arrange for filing of notice of settlement.
DRF	11/09/18	1.00	Submitted working copies of motion papers to calendar call at NYS Supreme.
DRF	11/09/18	0.10	Filed Notice of Settlement and supporting documents in NYS Supreme.
DRF	11/13/18	0.80	Submitted courtesy copy of Notice of Settlement with Order to Judge Ramos at NYS Supreme Court.

TOTAL FEES:

85,658.50

FEE SUMMARY

	RATE	HOURS	TOTALS
Darryl Fraser	150.00	2.60	390.00
Donald Flynn	325.00	4.00	1,300.00
Ethan W. Middlebrooks	150.00	44.70	6,705.00
Jeffrey E Glen	735.00	2.80	2,058.00
Jeffrey E Glen	715.00	6.10	4,361.50
Jeffrey E Glen	695.00	61.10	42,464.50
Jeffrey E Glen	675.00	6.50	4,387.50
Luma S Al-Shibib	495.00	23.10	11,434.50
Nathan J Donlon	275.00	4.50	1,237.50
Vivian Michael	200.00	56.60	11,320.00
TOTAL FEES:		212.00	85,658.50

COSTS through 12/31/18